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Letter to Editor  Published Date:- 2021-11-11

Effect of preterm premature rupture of membranes on neurodevelopmental outcome of infants among preterm
infants born at Hawassa comprehensive specialized Hospital of Sidama Region, Ethiopia, 2022

Objective: To verify whether preterm premature rupture of membranes has effect on neurodevelopmental outcome
of Infant among preterm infants born at Hawassa Comprehensive Specialized Hospital of Sidama region, Ethiopia,
2022.
Methods and materials: A prospective cohort study design will be conducted for 2 years and 6 months from March
1/2022 to August 30/2024. A total of 12 Midwives. 6 supervisors and 1 pediatric neurologist or psychiatrist will be
involved in the data collection process. All preterm infants will be recruited consecutively from preterm infants
admitted to neonatal intensive care unit from March 1/2022 to August 30/2022. The preterm infants will be
categorized into Exposed group (preterm infants born after preterm PROM) and non-exposed group (preterm infants
born after spontaneous preterm labour) and followed until 2 years of age to assess neurodevelopmental outcome of
infants The data will be entered into Epidata software and exported to SPSS software for windows version 23. For
analysis. Descriptive statistics will be computed. One-way Anova and post hoc comparisons with Scheffe’s
procedure will be used X2 test or Fisher’s exact test will be used to compare categorical variables.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-11-09

The role of urine metabolomics among newborn infants with hypoxic ishaemic encephalopathy: a literature review

Background: Perinatal asphyxia (PA) which may result in hypoxic ischaemic encephalopathy (HIE) affects four
million neonates worldwide and accounts for the death of one million of affected babies. The science of
metabolomics has become an area of growing interest in neonatal research, with a potential role in identifying useful
biomarkers that can accurately predict injury severity in perinatal asphyxia and HIE.
The aim of this review is to look at the evidence of the usefulness of urine metabolomics in predicting outcome in
PA/HIE. 
Methods: The key words used in the advanced search ‘urine metabolomics’ AND ‘perinatal asphyxia’ OR ‘hypoxic
ischaemic encephalopathy’, yielded 13 articles. 
Results: Of the selected thirteen studies, 38% (n = 5) were human studies, 31% (n = 4) were animal studies and
31% (n = 4) were review articles. The studies confirmed the involvement of known pathways in the development of
PA/HIE, primarily the Krebs cycle evidenced by accumulation of TCA cycle intermediates (citrate, ?-ketoglutarate,
succinate) and anaerobic pathways indicated by increased lactate. Other pathways involved include amino acid and
carbohydrate pathways. 
Conclusion: Metabolomic studies so far are promising in highlighting potential biomarker profiles in PA/HIE. Further
research is necessary to further clarify the role of identified metabolites in predicting outcome and prognosis in
neonates affected by PA/HIE.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-11-01

Needs in siblings of individuals with Down Syndrome and levels of coping Cali, Colombia
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Objective: To determine the needs and level of coping in siblings of people with Down Syndrome. 
Methods: Descriptive, cross-sectional study, carried out in 2016. Sample consisted of 30 siblings of people with
Down Syndrome between 6 and 60 years old. Using non-probability convenience sampling. Two instruments were
used to collect the information: a) a validated sociodemographic and needs survey of the siblings, designed by the
authors, and b). Callista Roy adaptation and coping survey validated. 
Results: 60% of the siblings report not having felt judged by other people when presenting their brother/sister with
Down syndrome. 73.3% of the siblings did not receive information about Down Syndrome from a nursing
professional, the need to strengthen the nursing care provided to the siblings of people with disabilities in this regard
is evident. 53.3% of these present a medium level of coping with respect to the condition of having a brother with
Down syndrome. 
Conclusion: Identified needs were: time needs, affective needs, family needs, social needs, economic and access to
information needs. Highlighting these needs allows the nursing professional to identify and consider the siblings of
people with Down Syndrome have different needs than the rest of the family nucleus. Where interventions aimed at
reducing the harmful effects and enhancing those characteristics of gain related with having a brother with Down
Syndrome.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-09-13

Effects of food programme for enhancing obesity children healthy of their abilities and expectations to self-efficacy
for preventing early childhood

This study aims to assess parents’ perceptions of their responses to the perceived awareness programme
competency abilities and expectations for enhancing parents on weight control of their pre-school children in
preventing with Obesity. It has defined self-efficacy as one’s belief in one’s ability to succeed in specific situations
and accomplish a task with the theoretical framework of Bandura’s Model by quasi-experimental research in 16
weeks. To promote the self-efficacy and expectations, the 10-item Questionnaire on Self-Efficacy Program, the
22-item Questionnaire on Parents’ Efficacy Interaction, and the 46-item Questionnaire on Parental Expectations
assessed parents’ perceptions. A sample size consisted of 14-pre-school children whose age ranged 2-5 years old
at the Child Development Demonstration Centre, Khon Kaen University was selected. Providing knowledge,
teaching, demonstration, experimentation, and organized activities were organized. Parents’ perceptions of their
abilities for controlling children’s weight and height with pre- and post-experimental programmes differentiated,
significantly. Parents’ responses to the post performances are over than pre-experiment for the QSEP, the QPEA,
and the QPE, differently. They answered and followed up on child management with parents online for 16 weeks,
continuously. The obese early childhood at the CDC Demonstration Centre, Faculty of Nursing used the food
programme to self-efficacy with their parents taking part and cooperating well in specifying research objectives.
There are 2,958,441 children in rural areas are lacking attention, because of food and health problems in the
19,171-Child Development Centres none yet have food programmes to prevent health and hygiene problems.
Although Thailand took the next leap forward for its investment in Early Childhood Development through legislation,
improved quality services, and social transfer grants for families with young children since 2018.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-09-13

Identity-related attitude in the child development centres for protecting educational asylum of early childhoods: From
rural communities to schooling cities

The global identities of parents’ popularity in rural communities to make-decision effects of their attitudes to transfer
their Early Childhood from Child Development Centres and Local Primary School for moving study into the schooling
cities that looks like children’ asylum of their educational conditions, problems, administration’ school directors,
teachers, and schools’ environments to protect that described. The involving CDCs’ perceptions got using the
25-item My CDC Identity Inventory (MCDCII) in five scales, three options. Teacher and Caregiver-Early Childhood
interactions have assessed with the 30-item Questionnaires on Teacher Identity Interaction (QTII) in five scales on
five options. The 10-item Local Identity-Related Attitude (LIRA) has been associated with a sample of 300 children’s
parents, teachers, and caregivers. The determination of efficient predictive value (R2) shows that 30% of accepted
the identities on cohesiveness, competitiveness, physical indoor and outdoor environmental development,
satisfaction, and strong-sense identity. 74% of their CDCs can protect the educational asylum of early childhoods
from rural communities. The R2 value shows 49% of the variance in children’s parents’ perceptions was because of
the MCDCII have associated. Despite Thailand’s success in expanding educational access, new empirical evidence
suggests that much more needs to be done to maximize the potential of its students. The performance gaps among
schools have disadvantaged and poorer-performing students have concentrated in small rural village schools. The
Thai pre-primary school system is dramatically lacking in qualified the CDCs’ learning environments and
achievements, and teachers. It allocated small rural schools teachers with lower qualifications and teaching
experience.
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Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-09-10

Associated indicator factors among inappropriate malfunctions’ development for the 9-month-old-baby

To investigate the associated an inappropriate development of the 9-month-old-baby with the Matched Case-Control
Study on five categories and three factors including predisposing, contributing, and complementary through the
babies’ malfunction development with the Analysis Research Method was analyzed. The babies’ developing crisis
was enhanced as the guidelines for promoting healthy babies’ development via the DSPM in the future of Thailand.
Creative the Interview Factor Questionnaire analyzed the 130-child caregivers’ parenting matching
65-pairs-case-control group into 5 parts: the Predisposing Factor Questionnaire, the Positive Interview Form; the
Baby-Self-Efficacy Form; the Inappropriate Contributing Interview Form; the Inappropriate Development Interview
Form for assessing the motor skills, self-efficacy, predisposing, contributing, and complementary factors of the
9-month-old-baby, respectively. Highest, Middle, and Lowest means levels are indicated. The child caregivers’ are
presenting responses, overall on the Predisposing Factor Questionnaire on five categories’ motor skills, and the
Inappropriate Development Interview Form showed off at the Middle Levels. The Positive Interview Form, the
Baby-Self-Efficacy Form, and the Inappropriate Contributing Interview Form comprised at the Highest Levels for the
predisposing, self-efficacy, and contributing factors for developing the 9-month-old-baby, respectively. To help
professionals assess the factors affecting a child’s development into environmental factors, biological factors,
interpersonal relationships, and early environments and experiences that identified in contributing to growth, brain,
emotional, social developments at early childhood are the GM, FM, RL, EL, and PS motor skills practices with the
DSPM for Thai’s children are also more likely to have health problems all child ages with the knowledge and skills.

Case Report  Published Date:- 2021-08-17

An incidental case report of Disc Battery Ingestion in a child with congenital hearing loss

Foreign body ingestion in children is a serious problem encountered among children. Approximately 80% of cases of
foreign body ingestions occur in children between the ages of six months and three years [1]. Button battery
ingestion occurs at an estimate rate of ten in one million people per year, a small group of which are retained in the
esophagus and later become complicated [2]. Button battery ingestion can lead to esophageal perforation and death
within hours if not appropriately diagnosed [3].

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-08-02

Associations of adverse social determinants of health with missed well-child visits and the role of caregiver social
support

Objective: To examine the association between adverse social determinants of health (SDH) and missed well-child
visits and the interaction with the level of caregiver social support.

Methods: This is a secondary data analysis of data collected from a SDH screening program conducted during
well-child visits with referral, navigation and follow-up services for patients. We included 573 adult caregivers who
accompanied patients aged 0-5 years to well-child visits and completed the screening from August 2017 to May
2018. The caregivers reported financial hardship, food insecurity, housing challenges, childcare difficulty,
transportation issues, insurance difficulty, job difficulty, and education needs. Our primary outcome was a no-show
(i.e., missed) to a well-child visit. Social support was dichotomized as low or high.

Results: Among 573 patients who completed the screening, 335 patients (76.4%) had at least one social need.
Financial hardship (p = 0.006), housing instability (p = 0.002), and no/poor childcare (p = 0.03) were associated with
missed well-child visits. In multivariable regression analysis, having Medicaid (aOR = 1.91 [1.17-3.10]) and unstable
housing (aOR = 6.79 [1.35-34.70]) were both associated with missed well-child visits. However, when social support
was added to the multivariable logistic model, both Medicaid and unstable housing were no longer associated with
missed well-child visits.

Conclusion: Adverse SDH such as financial hardship, housing instability, and childcare difficulty were associated
with missed well-child visits. However, with the addition of social support, this association was no longer significant.
This study supports the hypothesis that high social support may mitigate the association between well-child visits
among families experiencing adverse SDH.
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Review Article  Published Date:- 2021-07-12

Revisiting childhood pneumonia in low-recourse setting hospitals

Introduction: Pneumonia, defined as infection of lung parenchyma, is associated with severe complications
especially in the very young and old patients. It is the world’s leading cause of childhood mortality. The World Health
Organization (WHO) classification and guidelines are commonly used in Sudan in the diagnosis and management of
pneumonia patients. This review was the outcome of some researches done in Sudan by the author and his
colleagues. Management Systems were evaluated to give complete end to end solutions for serving patients along
with their records in hospitals and clinics in Sudan. The objective of the study was: To reflect author experience in
management of childhood pneumonia in Sudan and to determine feasible, affordable approach to pneumonia in
Sudan.

Methodology: Searching through PubMed for the author publication and review of publication by author in Sudan
regarding management of pneumonia.

Conclusion: Simple tests like chest X-ray, high WBC high-reactive protein, together with high temperature can
predict the need for urgent blood culture. Antibiotic treatment for childhood pneumonia weather that recommended
by WHO, b-lactam inhibitors or 3rd generation cephalosporin has the same outcome.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-06-16

Predictors of mortality in neonatal sepsis in a resource-limited setting

Introduction: Sepsis remains a major cause of death in neonatal period. Although significant advances in diagnosis,
therapeutic and prevention strategies have been noted, sepsis remains a common concern in clinical practice
especially in low-resource countries. The aim of this study was to determine the predictors of mortality in neonatal
sepsis in Lubumbashi city (Democratic Republic of Congo).

Methods: The records of newborns with sepsis managed in Neonatal Intensive Care Units in two University
Hospitals between November 2019 and October 2020 were studied. Binary and multiple logistic regressions have
been used to observe the association between independent variables and dependent variable.

Results: A total of 162 cases of neonatal sepsis were reviewed. The mortality rate of neonatal sepsis was 21% of
babies admitted. Very low birth weight (< 1500 grams) and primiparity were significantly associated with mortality in
neonatal sepsis (AOR = 12.66; 95% CI 2.40 to 66.86; p = 0.003 and AOR = 3.35; 95% Cl 1.31 to 8.59; p = 0.012,
respectively).

Conclusion: The mortality rate of neonatal sepsis was 21%. Very low birth weight and primiparity were significantly
associated with mortality in neonatal sepsis.

Case Report  Published Date:- 2021-05-20

A rare cause of neonatal diarrhoea: Microvillositary inclusion disease: about a case report
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Microvillositary inclusion disease also known as microvillositary atrophy is a rare congenital enteropathy containing
a border abnormality in the brushes of enterocytes, manifesting as severe rebellious diarrhea in newborns and
infants. It was first described in 1978 by Davidson, et al. The autosomal recessive mode of transmission is
suggested because of the frequency of familial cases and inbreeding. Histopathology plays an essential role in
establishing the diagnosis. In 2008, a common mutation was identified in most of the patients studied in the MYO5B
gene that codes for the Myosin Vb protein, which helped in understanding the etiopathogeny of this pathology poorly
described in the literature. The prognosis for this pathology is extremely bleak, requiring total parenteral nutrition for
child survival. Intestinal transplantation is for the moment the only long-term solution.

Materials and methods: We report the case of an infant aged 6 months, with no perinatal antecedent. There is 1st
degree consanguinity, the mother has a history of deaths in younger siblings in undetermined circumstances. Who
since the age of 3 days presents profuse liquid diarrhoea with malnutrition, dehydration and enormous abdominal
distension? Several diagnoses were suspected before the jejune biopsy was carried out, which led to the diagnosis
of a microvilliositary inclusion disease.

The aim of our work is to highlight the rarest cause of neonatal rebel diarrhoea and to know how to include it among
other differential diagnoses.

Case Report  Published Date:- 2021-05-17

Rapidly involuting congenital hemangioma associated with Kasabach-Merritt Syndrome

Background: Rapidly involuting congenital hemangioma (RICH) is a rare vascular tumor that is present at birth and
involutes during the first year of life. Kasabach-Merritt syndrome (KMS) is a complication of some vascular tumors
such as kaposiform hemangioendothelioma and tufted angioma associated with thrombocytopenia and
coagulopathy.

Results: The case of a 2-month-old infant with a diagnosis of RICH with thrombocytopenia and coagulation disorder,
successfully treated with surgical excision without complications or recurrence is presented.

Conclusion: The association between RICH and KMS is rare. Histopathological study, immunohistochemistry and
ultrasound findings are important for the diagnosis.

Brief summary: This report covers the rare association between rapidly involuting congenital hemangioma and
Kasabach-Merritt syndrome in a 2-months-old female infant.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-05-13

Clinical picture of pulmonary plague observed in the paediatric wards of antananarivo
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Introduction: In Madagascar, plague is a highly contagious acute endemic infectious disease. The diagnosis of the
most severe form of pneumonic plague remains difficult in children, hence the objectives of the present study; which
is to identify the clinical signs of this clinical form in children and to describe its epidemiological and evolutionary
profile.

Methods: A retrospective case-control study was conducted in four pediatric wards in Antananarivo during the urban
pneumonic plague outbreak from September 2017 to January 2018.

Those cases were defined as children aged 0-15 years old suspected of having plague with positive RDT and PCR,
and they were defined as children aged 0-15 years old with negative RDT and PCR.

Results: Fifty-two cases of pneumonic plague were identified, half of which (50%) were under 24 months of age.

A male predominance was noted with a sex ratio of 1.23 and 86.54% of the patients were from urban areas.

Several clinical signs were found but none was specific for pneumonic plague: cough (59.62% p: 0.5), dyspnea
(3.85% p: 0.16), chest pain (3.85% p: 0.26%), hemoptysis (7.69% p: 0.17), vomiting (9.62% p: 0.14), diarrhea
(11.54% p: 0.45), altered general condition (38.46% p: 0.24%).

Two deaths were noted (3.8%).

Conclusion: No specific clinical warning signs have been identified in childhood pneumonic plague. In the event of
an epidemic of urban pneumonic plague, any bacterial pneumonia should at least initially include active treatment
against Yersinia pestis.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-04-15

Factors associated with diagnostic delay in children with Wilms’ tumor

Background: In Wilms’ tumor, the time elapsed between clinical diagnosis and the start of treatment is clearly
associated with morbidity and mortality. As treatment delay can influence patient survival, identification of possible
causes can mitigate the consequences arising from prolonged diagnostic uncertainty.

Objective: To ascertain whether an initial diagnosis of Wilms’ tumor in the emergency department influences patient
prognosis depending on the type of referral for definitive treatment.

Patients and methods: Retrospective chart review of 98 children receiving treatment for Wilms’ tumor at the
Brazilian National Cancer Institute (INCA) between April 2003 and December 2016. Patients were categorized into
two groups: those referred directly from an emergency public department to INCA and those first transferred to
another hospital before being referred to INCA.

Results: Of the 98 cases included in the study, 42.9% were direct referrals and 57.1% were indirect referrals.
Presence of an abdominal mass was the most common presenting complaint, followed by abdominal pain. In cases
with larger tumors, the mean tumor volume was greater than reported elsewhere in the literature, suggesting longer
disease duration. Significantly higher tumor volumes were observed in patients with a palpable abdominal mass as
compared to those with the second most frequent complaint (abdominal pain).

Conclusion: The findings of this study support the hypothesis that patients diagnosed with kidney masses in the
emergency department are at greater risk of delayed diagnosis when they are referred first to a non-specialized
outside hospital than when referred directly to a specialized cancer treatment unit.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-04-14

Efficacy of intravenous immunoglobulins in the prophylaxis of neonatal sepsis
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Despite critical care advances, robust antibiotic therapy and improved strategies in early detection and prevention of
infection, the incidence of morbidity and mortality from neonatal sepsis worldwide in preterm and low birth weight
neonates remains overwhelmingly high. Neonatal sepsis is characterised by a clinical syndrome of systemic signs of
infection and bloodstream bacteraemia in newborns within the first months of life. The risk of sepsis in neonates is
inversely proportional to gestational age and birth weight due to deficiency in humoral immunity and the need for
more invasive supportive neonatal intensive care unit interventions. Adverse effects such as necrotising enterocolitis
associated with antimicrobial therapy are serious enough to warrant exploration of alternative therapeutic strategies.
Immunoglobulin replacement therapy offers hope of enhancing immune competence and reducing infection rates in
vulnerable populations. It is evident from the relevant studies to date that the benefits offered by intravenous
immunoglobulin prophylaxis may not be significant enough for routine hospital implementation. Further research to
better understand the mechanisms underlying immunodeficiency will lead to the realisation of alternative therapeutic
and prophylactic interventions.

Short Communication  Published Date:- 2021-03-29

Atypical presentation of congenital pneumonia: Value of lung ultrasound

A term neonate was transferred from a Local Neonatal Unit to our surgical Neonatal Intensive Care Unit on Day 2
due to abdominal distension with radiological appearances suggestive of intestinal obstruction. He was born by
Caesarean section with no risk factors for sepsis. He was intubated at birth for increased work of breathing and
failed planned extubation on Day 1. 

Review Article  Published Date:- 2021-03-29

Rationality and irrationality in the use of antibiotics in the epiclatino Latin American Neonatal Units
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Background: Recent years have seen chaos in the neonatology use of antibiotics with diverse opinions and
recommendations in international guidelines and societies. This has created great uncertainty in which cases to use,
for how long, and which tests apply to make these decisions.

We conducted a retrospective cohort study about the use of antibiotics in the EpicLatino neonatal units and a Latin
American network database, after noting these variations in the 2019 report.

Methods: For the year 2019 using the EpicLatino database, we included cases (only first admission) ? 32 weeks
gestational age at birth, excluding one unit that did not accept to participate.

The number of cases and days receiving antibiotics were recorded as well as the progression for each unit.
Inappropriate use of antibiotics was defined as greater than 3 days in patients with negative cultures (blood/CSF
cultures) excluding: major malformations, urinary tract infections, necrotizing enterocolitis (NEC) and cases with
suspected chorioamnionitis in the mother (the latter two only during the course of diagnosis of NEC or
chorioamnionitis).

Results: A total of 6,543 days of antibiotics were observed, 49.5% of cases had at least one positive blood/CSF
culture.

A total of 595 days of antibiotics without justification were found in 72 courses in 61 cases: 19.4% had no diagnosis
of infection in the database, 9.7% did not document any culture throughout their stay, and 51,4% obtained only one
blood/CSF culture during their entire stay. In the 58 cases with diagnosis of infection: 41% were clinical sepsis and a
diagnosis of pneumonia with a poor positive culture correlation was found. Furthermore, 74% of the unit’s didn´t use
pneumonia as a justification to use antibiotics.

Other diagnosis found: Conjunctivitis, NEC 1A and rotavirus NEC.

Conclusion: Although the method of reviewing the use of antibiotics in a database has a number of limitations,
especially the cause that motivated the use of antibiotics and other tools used for diagnosis of infections, the notable
differences between units is striking.

Although it is difficult to make recommendations to all units, it is important to control infections in some units and in
others to reduce the excessive use of antibiotics, especially with diagnosis of pneumonia in neonates and negative
blood/CSF cultures.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-03-25

An Audit on the implementation of administering Ondansetron in children with acute gastroenteritis and its effect on
admission rate

Acute gastroenteritis (AGE) is a common presenting complaint in paediatrics. Most often, the reason for admission
into hospital is to initiate intravenous rehydration in patients with severe dehydration and inability to tolerate oral
intake. We found that Ondansetron acts as a potent antiemetic to support an increased number of children receiving
oral hydration, and subsequently leading to decreased rates of admission. This study aims to audit the use of
Ondansetron to Oral Rehydration Therapy (ORT) on children with acute gastroenteritis, and its effect on admission
rates from the emergency department in University Hospital, Limerick (UHL). Data collected over a 3-month period
from June to August 2017 in which Ondansetron was not used was compared to another 3-month period when
Ondansetron was used. Several outcomes were measured including admission to hospital.

The rate of admission decreased by 15% [26/74 (35%) in 2017 to 16/81 (20%) in 2019 p = 0.22]. 81 patients
received Ondansetron, of which 79% were successfully rehydrated orally. The administration of Ondansetron
reduced the need for intravenous fluids and hospital admission overall in these children with AGE. This reduction
ultimately accounted for lower costs incurred by the Health Services Executive per patient, and also suggested the
anti-emetic use as a cost effective measure for managing and treating patients with AGE.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-03-25
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Factors associated with zinc prescription practice among children with diarrhea who visited public health facilities in
Addis Ababa, Ethiopia: A cross sectional study

Background: Diarrhea and nutrient deficiency worsen each other, and zinc is recommended to be included in clinical
management of diarrhea. Therefore, this investigation was done to assess zinc prescription practice to children with
diarrhea, identify factors associated with zinc prescription, and assess caregivers’ zinc’s perceived cost and
willingness to pay for.

Methods: A health institution based cross-sectional study was done. Caretakers of 609 children with diarrhea
attending health centers in Addis Ababa were included. Logistic regression was applied to identify variables
associated with zinc prescription.

Results: Zinc was prescribed to 62.1% of children. About 74.9% of the caregivers were willing to pay for zinc.
Previous use of zinc (AOR = 2.3; 95% CI: 1.34-4.01), exposure to zinc related message (AOR = 2.6, 95% CI:
1.53-4.60) and willingness to pay for zinc (AOR = 6.9; 95% CI: 3.84-12.66) were associated with zinc prescription.

Conclusion: Zinc was not administered to considerable proportion of children with diarrhea. Previous use of zinc,
exposure to zinc related message and willingness to pay for positively contributed to zinc prescription. Health care
workers shall be encouraged on zinc prescription. Intervention to increase willingness to pay for zinc and zinc
benefit communication shall be strengthened in parallel with operational researches.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-01-30

Maximal stability limits in adolescents with Tourette syndrome

We explored if adolescents with Gilles de la Tourette syndrome (GTS) had functional postural control impairments
and how these deficits are linked to a disturbance in the processing and integration of sensory information. We
evaluated the displacements of the center of pressure (COP) during maximal leaning in four directions (forward,
backward, rightward, leftward) and under three sensory conditions (eyes open, eyes closed, eyes closed standing
on foam). GTS adolescents showed deficits in postural stability and in lateral postural adjustments but they had
similar maximal COP excursion than the control group. The postural performance of the GTS group was poorer in
the eyes open condition (time to phase 1 onset, max-mean COP). Moreover, they displayed a poorer ability to
maintain the maximum leaning position under the eyes open condition during mediolateral leaning tasks. By
contrast, during forward leaning, they showed larger min-max ranges than control subjects while standing on the
foam with the eyes closed. Together, these findings support the idea that GTS produces subclinical postural control
deficits. Importantly, our results suggest that postural control disorders in GTS are highly sensitive to voluntary
postural leaning tasks which have high demand for multimodal sensory integration.

Research Article  Published Date:- 2021-01-15

Evaluation of influence of IL-6 C-572G gene polymorphism and clinical factors on positive platelet antibody test
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Background: Interleukin-6 (IL-6) promotes antibody production. The objective of this study was to investigate
whether IL-6 C-572G single nucleotide polymorphisms (SNP) and clinical factors are associated with positive
platelet antibody test.

Materials and methods: Thirty platelet recipients with platelet antibodies (responders) and 20 platelet recipients
without platelet antibodies (non-responders) were randomly selected. The -572 C>G (rs 1800796) SNPs in the
promoter region of IL-6 gene were genotyped by polymerase chain reaction (PCR)-restriction fragment length
polymorphism (RFLP) method. Solid phase red cell adherence assay (SPRCA) was used for platelet antibody
detection.

Results: Age, sex, percentage patients with benign diseases, and percentage of patients with homozygotes for the
C allele at position -572 of the IL-6 gene were similar between responders and non-responders. Although the
amounts of platelets pheresis transfused to patients with hematologic diseases were higher than those of
non-hematologic diseases (47.2 ± 54.2 vs. 17.4 ± 13.8 units, p = 0.019), detection rate of platelet antibodies was
lower in patients with hematologic diseases than that in patients with non-hematologic diseases (42.3% vs. 79.2%, p
= 0.01).

Conclusion: There was no association between IL-6 C-572G gene polymorphism and positive reactivity in solid
phase platelet antibody detection method in platelet recipients.

Case Report  Published Date:- 2021-01-11

Drug Reaction with Eosinophilia and Systemic Symptoms (DRESS): A case with adverse reaction to three drugs
alternately administered

Drug reaction with eosinophilia and systemic symptoms (DRESS) syndrome is a severe multiorgan hypersensitivity
reaction mostly caused by several eliciting drugs in patients with a genetic predisposition. Incidence of DRESS in
children is very variable, frome 1:1000 to 1:10.000, and the mortality rate seems to be lower than 10%.
Anti-convulsants are the main drugs involved both in adults and in children. The treatment of choice is the prompt
withdrawn of the offending drug and using intravenous immunoglobulins and corticosteroids used in synergy. In
recent years, emerging studies have outlined the disease more clearly. We present a pediatric case in which the
patient developed DRESS syndrome as a result of exposure to lamotrigine before and carbamazepine after and a
relapse after exposure to omeprazole. Starting from this case report we provide an overview on DRESS Syndrome.
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